LARIMER COUNTY BID #14-29

EMERGENCY VEHICLE ACCESSORIES

FLEET SERVICES DEPARTMENT

JANUARY 9, 2015 2:00 P.M.

Bids to consider the purchase of various emergency vehicle accessories for the Larimer County Fleet Services Department were received and
opened on Friday, January 9, 2015 at 2:00 p.m. in the Purchasing Department. Bids were opened by Les Brown, Purchasing Agent | and recorded
by Sarah Brightman, Department Specialist I. The following bids were received:

Specific Product Manufacturers

Super
AT Whelen Bright Brooking Feniex Pro-gard Recreational
Addendum #1 Plus Engineering | LEDs Industries, | Industries, | Go Rhino | Products, | Havis, Inc. | Electrical
VENDOR NAME | Acknowledged Total Co, Inc. Inc. Inc. Inc. Total Cost | LLC™ Total Cost | LLC
Total Cost Total Total Cost | Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost
Cost
Cost
Adamson . . . . : .
Industries Corp. Y No Bid $910.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $13,510.00 | $10,990.00 | $12,380.00 | No Bid
AV-Tech . . .
Electronics Y $1,150.00 | $840.00 No Bid $1,225.00 $3,950.10 No Bid $8,741.90 $13,142.55 | No Bid
Holzberg
Communications, N $1,190.00 | $952.00 $494.00 | $1,820.00 $4,662.00 $13,605.00 | $11,400.00 | $16,836.00 | $19,664.00
Inc
Eleezrtfiig‘l’”a' Y $1,307.50 | $889.00 $544.70 | $1,160.60 | $3,465.00 | $10,200.65 | $8,645.00 | $11.211.31 | No Bid
Ties4lLess, LLC Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13,200.00

The totals highlighted in yellow are the most responsive, responsible, lowest price bid by specific manufacturer.

No decision of award was made pending review and recommendation by the Larimer County Fleet Services Department.

The Larimer County Fleet Services Department reviewed the bids and recommends accepting the bids from the most responsive, responsible,
lowest price bids by specific manufacturer as per the attached departmental recommendation.

The Larimer County Purchasing Department concurs with the above recommendations.

‘VHeather MacMillan
Dlrector

Purchgm //< //5 /(j N

Carol L. Block, Financial Services Director
For the Board of Larimer County Commissioners




PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

LARIMER
COUNTY 200 W. Oak Street, Suite 4000

Fort Collins, Colorado 80521
(970) 498-5955
Fax (970) 498-5959
COMMITTED TO EXCELLENCE

TO: Matt Kendall, Larimer County Fleet Services
FROM: Les Brown, Larimer County Purchasing Department
DATE: 1/9/2015

SUBJECT: Bid results from B#14-29 Emergency Vehicle Accessories

Transmitted for your review and recommendation, are the bids received to consider the purchase of various
emergency vehicle accessories.

When you have completed your review of the bids, please prepare your recommendation on this form and
return the form to me. If you do not recommend awarding the bid to the lowest bidder, please explain why.
This document will be considered a public record and open to inspection.

Fleet Services recommends accepting the bids from:

» Av-Tech Electronics for the Antenna Plus manufactured items in the amount of $1,150.00.

s Av-Tech Electronics for the Whelen Engineering Co. manufactured items in the amount of $840.00.

e Holzberg Communications, Inc. for Super Bright LEDs Inc. manufactured items in the amount of
$494.00.
Recreational Electrical for the Brooking Indusfries Inc. manufactured items in the amount of $1,160.60.
Recreational Electrical for the Feniex Industries Inc. manufactured items in the amount of $3,465.00.
Recreational Electrical for the Go Rhino manufactured items in the amount of $10,200.65.
Recreational Electrical for the Pro-gard Products LLC manufactured items in the amount of $8,645.00.
Recreational Electrical for the Havis, Inc. manufactured items in the amount of $11,211.31.
Ties4Less, LLC for the Recreational Electrical manufactured items in the amount of $13,200.00.

For the following reasons: Most responsive, responsible, lowest price bid by specific manufacturer.

THIS RECOMMENDATION MUST BE SIGNED BY THE DEPARTMENT HEAD

YJ\MM Fleet I*’é“’@ozg

DEPA TMENT HEAD SIGNATURE DEPARTMENT DATE
Thank you.




